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Key:	
• Appropriate and challenging research question developed thoughtfully and independently 

by constructive dialogue, responding fully to feedback. 
• Strong and consistent understanding of appropriate research methods. Methodology is 

carefully and thoughtfully considered and shows an innovative approach. The work is 
independently managed without over- reliance on teacher support. 

• Highly effective and clear maintenance and use of a research log showing full support of 
the research process. 

• Reflection on the scope, nature and limitations of the research is clear and cogent. 
Reflection shows a thoughtful and mature approach to how and why personal viewpoints 
may have altered during the research process. 

 

August	22,	2016:	
Today I met with my instructor for the first time and she introduced the course to me. She 
provided me with the syllabus of A-Level Global Perspectives and we discussed the initial steps 
to starting my research. She told me to work on formulating two questions that I believe are 
interesting, important to me, and something that I feel passionately about. After forming and 
researching both of these questions, I will meet with my instructor to decide between the two of 
us which question I should choose as my final research topic. Additionally, my instructor gave 
me a checklist of exercises that will help remind me of how to validate, analyze, and evaluate 
research information. Among these exercises is assisting students who are taking AS Level 
Global Perspectives with validations, citations, and other skills needed for papers one, two and 
three. Assisting AS Global Students will be a task that I will complete every week day along 
with my own studies. This will help me to remain adept in the skills that I will need to write 
paper four while I am researching.  

August	24,	2016:	
I started thinking of issues that I feel passionately about to research. In AS Global Perspectives, I 
favored medical related issues because I have an infatuation for medical research and plan to 
study medicine in the near future. With this in mind, I began researching topics related to 
medical research. I found the Johns Hopkins Medicine Research page useful, however, none of 
the topics listed jumped out at me immediately. I then decided to read a few recent news articles 
on medically acclaimed research. I was browsing through the news articles and came across one 
on black market organ harvesting. I had heard of this before, but never became interested enough 
to read further than a title or so. Turns out, I most certainly should have read further in the past 
because this topic is unbelievably intriguing. After reading several more articles on organ 
harvesting, including “Body Snatchers: Organ Harvesting for Profit” and “The Ends of the Body: 
Commodity Fetishism and the Global Traffic in Organs” I was captivated. There are unlimited 
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ways to view this problem as it arises in many different manners. The problem ranges from 
doctors who are illegally taking and selling organs from their patients to people in LDC’s 
kidnapping and stealing organs from citizens on the street.    

August	25	&	26,	2016:	
Today I assisted students studying AS Level Global Perspectives on APA Citations to freshen up 
my personal skills on such. This will help me because I haven’t reviewed APA since the last 
semester of school and because I will need this skill for paper four, it is vital that I allow myself 
to review and practice this skill before writing. Along with helping the AS Global students, I also 
continued researching organ harvesting. My instructor met with a group of us A-Level Global 
students to reiterate the tasks we should be completing and to go over any questions/confusions. 
She suggested we find several books to read to supplement our research. I am now looking to 
find different books about the issue of black market organ harvesting. Moreover, I am reading 
about other medical-related issues to research in search of a second question.  

August	29,	2016:	
Today while watching the news, I heard a story on CNN that there is currently a strong demand 
on the U.S. black market for kidney donors. Several people admitted to the news agency, and 
thus the world, that they are selling or previously sold one of their kidneys solely because they 
need or want the money. They earn this money by selling a part of their body, which, to me, 
seemed eccentric because in no way would I ever imagine donating an organ for the satisfaction 
of getting paid. This opened a whole new door to research for me because I now am thinking of 
this issue in an economical perspective. Not only is this an issue of ethics and medical ability, 
but is expanded to economics due to the massive revenue it can bring a donor or a stealer. 
Beyond this research, I reread my paper two from AS Global Perspectives to remind myself of 
the research process and to reflect on what sources I thought were good and which I thought 
could have been better.  
 



August	30,	2016:	
I continued assisting AS Global students on fallacies which will help me when reading articles to 
distinguish between reliable and unreliable sources. I also researched and attempted to narrow 
down books that I plan on reading for my first topic. I found Black Markets: The Supply and 
Demand of Body Parts a potential read due to its relevancy to my topic and interesting title. As it 
seems that this book will address different aspects of the issue, I believe it will be a great place to 
start, however I may need a more specific book further in my research. I additionally started 
formulating a question that involves the black market organ harvesting. I am currently working 
with “Should organ harvesting take place on the black market?” Although this question would 
work for what I plan on doing at the time, I don’t particularly like it and will tinker with the 
structure and wording as I go along.  

 
 

August	31,	2016:	
I decided that in my first topic question, I want to include the word “trafficking” when 
addressing the black market of organ harvesting because I feel that the definition of this word, as 
defined by the Cambridge English Dictionary as “the activity of buying and selling goods or 
people illegally”, thoroughly represents the process of organ harvesting on the black market. I 
believe the use of this term in my question will clarify the research topic and increase the 
accuracy of the question. Today with AS Global students, I assisted in teaching and formulating 
validations for electronic sources. This forced me to review my personal validations that I used 
previously and to start thinking in terms of evaluation of sources. This task will surely help me to 
further my evaluation skills while validating sources for my own research. My instructor checked 
in on my logs to ensure that I am keeping up with them and reminded me of the tasks I need to 
be completing, such as formulating my two questions, finding books on those topics, and 
practicing skills needed for paper four.  

(Black Market The Supply and Demand of Body Parts, 2016) 



September	1	&	2,	2016:	
I went to the library to look for inspiration for a second topic to formulate my second question. 
While browsing the non-fiction science section, I came across a book that caught my eye. It was 
titled Infectious Madness. The book’s category could be considered psychology but it is 
specifically about the science of “catching” a mental illness from germs present in our everyday 
lives. After reading the synopsis of the book, I was left wanting to know more about how people 
could “catch” a mental illness and whether this was common and where. I began researching this 
further online and discovered that “catching” a mental illness is an actual threat to people all over 
the world. Additionally, during this time, I helped AS Global students with forming questions. 
This skill is something I needed to refresh myself of considering I haven’t used this skill since 
the last semester of school. Helping the AS students will moreover help me to better construct 
my two questions needed for my course.  

                                                                                 (Infectious Madness, 2016) 

	

	

September	5,	2016:	
Today I did not have school due to the national holiday, Labor Day. In spite of this, I took 
advantage of the day to continue my research. I decided to formulate my two research questions 
as my topics are already solidified. This will help me to stay on schedule considering my 
instructor wants my proposal submitted to her by October 20. For my first topic regarding organ 
trafficking, I believe a question such as “Organ trafficking: saving lives or ruining them?” would 
be most intriguing and best fitting. For my second topic regarding germs and the ability to catch 
a mental illness, I believe a question such as “Can you catch mental illness?” would be best fit 
for the topic area. Although these questions may change throughout my research progress, I feel 
as of this moment, these are the best fit questions to allow me to move on in my research. 

September	6,	2016:	
I met with my instructor as well as some other A Level global students and we discussed the 
tasks needed to be completed before she allows us to meet with her over which question our 



research will form from. Of these tasks is completing a literature review or research review on 
both topics that we choose to research. My instructor offered us her personal literature review on 
her doctoral dissertation to use as an example for our own literature review. A literature review 
will help me to organize my research as well as solidify a direction that I want my essay to go in 
before deciding which topic will be better fit for my final research essay. Along with a literature 
review, my instructor is requiring us to have found two authors for each topic of research who 
have concrete judgement or insight on the chosen topics. As I have already found two authors, I 
am well on my way to completing these tasks in order to have my meeting with my instructor.  

September	7	&	8,	2016:	
I went to a library in search of books to begin to develop a concrete background on my two 
research topics. I found through research that Gulf Gate Library had a large selection on mental 
illness books so I went there and found two books on mental illness in their inventory. The books 
take contrasting views on what causes psychiatric disorders. The first book is the work I 
mentioned previously, Infectious Madness, and argues mental illness is caused by germs in our 
environment. The second book is titled Anatomy of an Epidemic, and argues mental illness is 
caused by biological occurrences and inheritance. These books, I believe, will enable me to see 
mental illness from different viewpoints which will solidify my background knowledge on 
psychiatric disorders. Additionally, I started reading papers from past A Level Global Students 
who received high scores to take note of different styles and methodology for writing this paper.  
 
 
 

(Infectious Madness, 2016)                       (Anatomy of an Epidemic, 2016) 
 

September	9,	2016:		
Today I went to a different library, Fruitville Library, in search of books on organ trafficking. I 
found two books on the subject which give different perspectives on the black market of organ 
trafficking. The first book is titled The Red Market which is an account of a world renowned 
journalist’s journey through the multibillion dollar underground trade of human body parts. The 
second is titled The Slaughter, and goes into the organ trafficking market in China where people 



kill others in order to sell their organs. These books will broaden my perspective on the issue as 
well as provide me with the background knowledge I need to move forward in my research. 
Along with my library visit, I also assisted AS Global students by proofreading their 
deconstruction assignment for their course. This reminded me of the components I need to look 
for while deconstructing books or articles that I read. I believe this task will especially help me 
when I begin reading my books so that I can break down what I am reading to fully use the work 
to its potential.  
 

 
(The Red Market, 2016)                               (The Slaughter, 2016) 
 
 
 

September	12,	2016:	
I met with another A Level Global Perspectives student whom I will frequently work with when 
peer reviewing, planning, or encouraging in the research process. For the purposes of this log I 
will call her Sierra. Sierra and I discussed our topics and advised each other on the wordings of 
our questions. We also agreed that we should start planning out our research in a concept map 
form to keep organized while working through the process. She appreciated the questions I have 
currently but confirmed that they may change depending on where my research takes me. I also 
continued helping AS Global students in learning the basic skills needed to be successful in the 
course, such as deconstruction, setting up reference pages, and crafting validation statements. 
Helping other students learn these skills will ultimately make my skill set stronger in these areas 
which will help me once I begin writing my paper.  
 

September	13,	2016:	
Today I began reading the books that I checked out at the library. Due to the fact that I will be 
reading multiple books at once in order to maintain time management, I decided to keep a 
running list of notes for each of the books I will read. These lists will be comprised of facts that I 
want to remember, things I believe are interesting, notes for direction of my essay, and anything 
else pertaining to my research that I believe will help me. These lists will then be used to plan 
my research and construct my scaffolding once the time comes. Additionally, I helped AS Global 
students with writing/editing their first essay. This reminded me of the methods I found useful 



while writing my own essays and will surely help me when moving forward and writing my A 
Level essay.  

September	14,	2016:	
I researched how to write a literature review today and I found a website that gives the basics of 
how to write it. This is a skill that I don’t have much experience with so I feel that I should 
familiarize myself with the task as much as possible. I believe I now have a basic understanding 
of what a literature review is. On top of this, I read the literature reviews of students in my 
school who took and scored highly on A Level Global Perspectives last school year. This 
especially helped me because I obtained a visual of approximately how long my personal review 
should be and I got an idea of the components that need to be in the review. I also continued to 
read the books that I checked out from the library.  

September	15	&	16,	2016:	
Today I started researching the topic organ trafficking on the internet. I wanted to browse the 
different articles that came up when I searched the overall topic. I found that many articles talked 
out China and Indonesia, common places of organ trafficking. I also found that like human 
trafficking, organ trafficking attracts organ transplant tourism. Furthermore, I found an article on 
who it is that is harvesting these organs to sell. One interesting fact, according to Philip Perry, is 
that the UN is currently looking into reports that ISIS may be selling its victims organs to fund 
their terrorist activities. These research findings are helping me to build a broader sense of 
knowledge on the topic of organ trafficking so that I can begin collecting literature for my 
literature review.  

September	19,	2016:	
Today I discussed with my instructor my topic of organ trafficking. I felt shocked but excited 
after finding out more on how doctors in America were being linked to ordering organs from 
ISIS victims. I felt the urge to talk to someone about this problem and turned to my instructor, 
Dr. Crihfield, who I knew would share my excitement. We discussed this subject and some other 
A-Level students joined in on the conversation. Afterwards, my instructor unofficially told me 
that I had found my final research topic. She explained this in a way that truly made me think. 
She said “…well it seems like you didn’t pick your issue, but instead your issue picked you”. 
The more I thought about this, the more sense it made. I truly didn’t pick this issue, but rather 
stumbled upon one single person’s case of organ trafficking and was impacted so heavily that I 
had to know more. This issue, although if you asked me a year ago I would be largely unaware, 
is now something that I feel passionately about and genuinely curious of. I look forward to 
finding out more in the near future.  

September	20,	2016:	
I obtained a copy of the A-Level global perspectives syllabus today and read through it 
thoroughly. I made notes of questions that I plan on asking my instructor once she returns from 
her AICE training on advanced global perspectives. I look forward to moving on in my research 
process by confirming what I need to be doing according to the syllabus. I also look forward to 
hearing what my instructor learned at this training that pertains to A-Level global perspectives.  



September	21,	2016:	
Today I started an annotated bibliography of sources that I find interesting or helpful for my 
research on organ trafficking. I also started organizing some of the research that I found 
previously that helped me build my question. This annotated bibliography will help me to keep 
organized of my sources while I progress so that I can remember what each source was without 
having to re-read it. Organizing my research will help me move forward and start building 
reasons for my argument as I review literature on the subject.  

September	23,	2016:	
Over the next couple of days, I will be preparing for my meeting with my instructor to decide my 
final research topic. The preparation for this will be a good amount of research in order to 
solidify my background on the two subjects. I will also prepare a small scaffolding for both 
topics in order to establish that there really are two sides to the questions and that there is enough 
research on the subject. This available information and past research is vital to complete a 
literary review and to base a research essay of off.  

September	27,	2016:		
I scheduled a private meeting with my instructor today to discuss my two topics in full and 
decide which of the two would be best fit for researching. We decided that my official topic will 
be human organ trafficking. However, she told me that I could use the other topic to practice 
writing portions of the essay that she would be able to give me feedback on. Although I decided 
my official topic in this meeting, I realized my journey was far from over. We discussed at 
length the different aspects of organ trafficking. In this discussion, I realized that my question 
was far too broad than I wanted it to be. I was suggested to make a concept map of my original 
question and all branching questions in order to organize my thoughts and formulate what route I 
wanted to go.  



September	28	&	29,	2016:	
I continued creating my concept map as ideas came to me. I discussed with many friends and 
fellow students the subject of organ trafficking and received outside knowledge and opinions on 
the subject. This helped me to determine what aspects of organ trafficking people didn’t know 
about, or found interesting. It also helped me create additional questions. After some time, I 
ended with this:  

 
 
 



 

October	3,	2016:	
Of these sub-topic questions, I was leaning most towards “Are American doctors funding ISIS’s 
war on terror?” This question was most interesting to me and I felt strongly connected to it as 
one day I hope to be an American doctor; however, I was disgusted by the fact that they were 
linked to buying organs from ISIS. After further discussion with my instructor, I realized that I 
needed to make this question broader, seeing as there wasn’t much data on the specific subject. I 
know that I want to create a clever question that addresses who is to blame for the organ 
trafficking crisis. Over the next couple days, I will be brainstorming questions for this.  

October	6,	2016:	
Over the past couple of days, I have been playing around with different questions. Ultimately, I 
decided that the question about American doctors and ISIS was too specific and too recent to be 
able to find a good background of information on. I started thinking about the broad scheme of 
organ trafficking and I realized that the people involved in the trafficking can be put into 
categories of the buyer, the doctor, the receiver, and the middleman. I realized that I wanted to 
write my essay on essentially who is most to blame for black market organ trafficking. I just had 
to figure out how to put this into a question. I decided to talk to my instructor to hear her input on 
my dilemma. She told me it reminded her of the children’s rhyme “Rich man, poor man, beggar 
man, thief…” This immediately stood out to me because this rhyme is the children’s way of 
choosing a person which can be symbolically related back to how I am researching who is the 
most to blame for organ trafficking. Thus, I decided my question would be “Organ Trafficking: 
Rich man, poor man, beggar man, thief?” 

October	10-14,	2016:	
During this week, I worked on my proposal. I wrote a draft proposal containing the following: 
why I wanted to research this topic, how I was going to organize my research, what I had learned 
so far, and how it affected me. I revised my draft and gave it to three other A-Level Global 



students to review. I made a few changes after reading these reviews and repeated the process 
several more times until I felt truly satisfied with my final copy. I submitted this proposal to my 
instructor to be sent to Cambridge. While I did this, I was also using the time to continue 
researching lightly. Although I know I have to wait on my proposal’s approval to fully continue, 
I decided that it wouldn’t hurt to continue to read about my topic and organize my thoughts and 
ideas. I continued reading articles and journals on black market organ trafficking.  

October	17-21,	2016:	
Over the course of this week I have awaited on the return of my proposal. During this, I 
continued keeping updated on my topic and reading several books on the subject. I also have 
taken the time to research the second topic that is aforementioned. I will use this topic to write a 
small section of the research essay so that my instructor can give me feedback on how I am 
doing with the skills needed to earn high marks on this exam. Alongside this, I have been 
grading scaffoldings and other AS assignments in order to keep my skills sharp. As it is said, if 
you can teach something it means you truly know it yourself. Thus, grading the AS student’s 
papers greatly helps me to make sure I am doing all the skills I need for paper 4 correctly.  

October	26,	2016:	
I received my grader’s comments on my proposal and found out it was not approved. At first this 
was a huge disappointment for me. I had high hopes in my proposal and was puzzled as to why it 
wasn’t approved. After reading the comments many times, I beyond agree with the grader. Some 
of the comments were that the title was not in the form of a question and that the report should 
take the form of a debate. I am grateful that the grader gave me these comments because I feel 
that how I currently had my report planned out would not have worked. It is extremely helpful 
that the commenter also told me the research report was comparable to a debate. This helped me 
to realize that I needed to establish two clear perspectives on the issue. 

October	27	–	November	1,	2016:	
Over this time, I worked on writing a new proposal to re-submit. I decided to keep the same issue 
of organ trafficking because I feel passionately about this issue and I believe this will lead itself 
to a deep analyzation of the problem. I remade my question and ultimately decided on “Is organ 
trade an ethical solution to resolving organ shortages?” This question is much more debatable 
and allows me to clearly argue from two different perspectives. This question changed my 
research in that I will be focusing on whether organ trade, or the selling of human body parts, is 
ethical. I’ve considerably narrowed my research with this question but clearly defined what I will 
focus on. This will help me to remain focused on the issue when conducting a literature review 
or writing the research report. In this proposal, I’ve defined what two sides of this I will be 
arguing by saying, “Some individuals believe that organ trade is acceptable and ethical because it 
provides incentive for people to donate organs which could save someone’s life. In a time of 
severe shortages of organs being donated, it is a large medical concern that organs are donated. 
Nonetheless, others believe that organ trade is immoral and unethical for many reasons, 
including it goes against religious beliefs and it assigns an arbitrary value on the human body.” I 
sent this proposal for regrading.  



November	3,	2016:	
I received my comments from my re-submission of the proposal. My proposal was approved 
with proviso. My grader approved with the proviso that I can present a debate between two 
distinct overall perspectives and support each with arguments and reliable evidence. My grader 
also suggested that I reword my question to either “Is the organ trade an ethical solution to 
transplant organ shortages?” or “Is organ trading an ethical solution to transplant organ 
shortages?”. I will be using “Is organ trading an ethical solution to transplant organ shortages?”. 
I plan on reading the comments and following them very closely throughout the remaining 
process of my research. Within the next couple of weeks, I will be gathering reliable evidence 
that supports both sides of this issue.  

November	7-11,	2016:	
Over the course of this week I have spent my time reflecting on the graders comments as well as 
helping AS Global students in order to prepare myself to begin writing my own report. Thinking 
back on the proposal process, I’ve realized that I learned a lot. I learned that my research must 
take the form of a debate and have two overall perspectives. I also learned that it is sad, yet 
extremely helpful to be told no. What I mean by this is that I realized that my research report 
would not have been as successful if I wasn’t not approved and given the chance to think about 
what the report requires and how I should be setting it up. With my original question, I was 
trying to take on too much in a 5000-word report. There would have been no way I could do it. 
The grader’s comments ultimately helped me to narrow my research and realize what the 
requirements of the report is. So I greatly thank the grader. Additionally, I’ve been helping the 
AS students with learning how to analyze. I am doing this with the help of some other A-Level 
Global students by putting together a lesson on analyzing. This will greatly help me to become 
better at analyzing myself and will help me when writing my research report.  

November	14,	2016:	
This week I will be working on writing part of a sample paper for my instructor and peers to 
grade. I will be writing on my alternative topic of mental illness so that I can give this to my 
instructor and so that she can help me determine the skills I need to improve on.  

November	16-18,	2016:	
For the demonstration of my analysis and evaluation skills I found an article published by the 
Research Institute for Infectious Mental Illness on how the Herpes infection can cause mental 
illness in unborn infants. This practice helped me to refresh my skills of searching for credible 
quotes to support my thesis, a skill that I needed to refresh on. With this example from the 
research institute, I analyzed the content and I analyzed the source. Using both of these, I made 
an overall evaluation of the quote according to the thesis. This practice exceedingly helped me to 
refresh my analysis and evaluation skills, which are vital in paper 4. My instructor got the 
comments back to me quickly and confirmed that I did the exercise correctly and that my skills 
are up to par.  

November	21	&	22,	2016:		
My instructor asked me to instruct a lesson on analyzing for the AS level global students. I had 
the task of preparing and carrying out a lesson so that the students could better understand the 



skill of analyzing. This task would also help me to deepen my understanding of analysis. Thus, 
over the course of the weekend and some of the week I prepared a lesson on analyzing using a 
tool that I knew the students would understand: social media. I had them analyze social media 
posts according to the thesis “Should I quit social media?”. I felt that this method worked well in 
teaching the students how to analyze. They understood the social media posts and realized that in 
analyzing, they didn’t need to summarize the post but simply explain how the post effected the 
thesis and why it was important in proving the thesis. After the activity, I feel much better about 
being able to analyze excerpts or quotes for my own research report considering I was able to 
grade and comment on each student’s analysis that they turned in to me. I additionally feel that 
my understanding between analysis and evaluation has deepened. 

November	23-25,	2016:	
During this time, I did not have class due to the American Holiday Thanksgiving. In spite of this, 
I took advantage of the break in order to start scaffolding the ethics of organ trading. I began 
planning out the different reasons to support my thesis/concession. I additionally continued 
researching quotes and excerpts to support both sides of the issue. I am keeping a running 
annotated bibliography so that I can easily see which sources I have used or need to use.  This 
bibliography will be useful for when I go to write my literature review. I especially took 
advantage of the break to organize my thoughts and research. I updated my notebook that my 
instructor is having us keep and I organized my research into the beginning of my scaffolding. 
This will prepare me for a fresh start this coming week to work to finish my scaffolding due on 
the 15th of December.  
 

November	28-30,	2016:	
I started officially formulating my literature review. I reexamined the different aspects of the 
debate of which I will tackle and I made note of the categories that must be discussed in order to 
give a relevant review of literature for my research. The following are the sub-titles I came up 
with for my review: 

• Overview 
• Ethicality 
• Legality  
• Religious Standpoints 
• Medical Standpoints  
• Influence of Western World 

These titles will give me the ability to wholly review the research already done by leading 
specialists in this topic area. I also confirmed and reworded the reasons I wrote previously and 
began searching for/gathering evidence to support those reasons.  

December	5-7,	2016:	
Over these days I reviewed sources from my annotated bibliography and gatherings from my 
desk research in order to plan out sources for my scaffolding. I went through my compiling of 
sources and categorized which support the different reasons for my thesis and counter-thesis and 
sorted them accordingly. After this, I removed the sources that I didn’t feel best supported my 
reasons. With what was remaining, I put into the scaffolding. When necessary, I researched more 



material to support my reasons. This use of desk research best fits my area of discussion because 
there is a sufficient amount of data readily available on the topic of organ trade, so much that it is 
unnecessary for me to do primary research. After assigning sources as evidence, I began the task 
of validating the authors of those sources and evaluating the evidence against the thesis.  

December	8	&	9,	2016:	
I continued working on my scaffolding. The final product of the scaffolding will make the essay 
writing more organized and allow my peers to easily critique my writing before putting the work 
into essay format. The scaffolding is to include everything that the essay will except transitional 
phrases. Thus, it is important to work on this as much time as I can in order to ensure that it is up 
to my standards. While working on this, I’ve been reviewing evaluation in other essays and 
methodology to guarantee that I receive as many marks as possible on evaluation, a particularly 
challenging skill in my opinion.  

December	12-14,	2016:		
As I continued research, I realized there was an alternative perspective to the counter-thesis that I 
had not thought of previously. I recognized that organ trading could actually reduce societal 
health care costs. Economists from the University of Chicago found that by comparing the costs 
of paying a living donor to trade their organs to the costs of remaining on dialysis (the alternative 
to receiving a transplant). Dialysis is typically covered by health care, and because dialysis is 
extremely expensive, replacing it with a system where a donor would be payed to donate would 
reduce societal health care costs. Findings as such open further discussion to the ethicality of 
organ trade.  

December	15	&	16,	2016:	
During research, I additionally found leading author on such issues, Kate Greasley, wrote 
extensively on how the monetary value of organs creates a vulnerability to exploitation of the 
poor. This is a serious concern that deserves much attention when dealing with the ethicality of 
organ trade. One of the biggest concerns of this method is the fact that it would exploit the poor, 
who are in most need of money. It is an immense advantage to my research to find authors such 
as Greasley.  

December	19,	2016-January	2,	2017:	
Over this period of time, class was not in session due to the holidays. Before we left for break, a 
group of A Level students submitted our scaffoldings to our instructor for her to distribute them 
to us so that we could review each other’s before writing the final draft of the essay. Our 
instructor agreed to send the scaffoldings to us after the break. So during this time, I took a break 
from my research to help me clear my mind and allow me to review my work after I come back 
with an open and fresh cognizance.  

January	3-6,	2017:	
After a period of thought and reflection, I decided to review the authors that I planned on citing 
for my report. I noticed one of my quotations was from the Quran. It reads, “So set your heart on 
the religion as a people of pure faith, the origination of Allah according to which He originated 
mankind; There is no altering Allah’s creation; that is the upright religion…” (Quran 30:30, 



Oxford World's Classics edition). Considering this is such a highly followed source and 
significant to many people around the world, I felt this source needed a deep validation: The 
quoted material comes from the Quran, described by select Muslim scholars as the Arabic speech 
of Allah that was revealed to the Prophet Muhammad both in word and in meaning and was 
collected between the two covers of the mushaaf, narrated in mutawaatir chains, and is a 
challenge to humankind. Nonetheless, followers of this work only account for just over a fifth of 
the population worldwide.  

January	9-11,	2017:	
During this time, I was given a copy of five other A-Level Global student’s scaffoldings to peer 
review and help them make any corrections necessary to increase their marks on this paper. I 
began to make general comments on those. This helped me exceedingly because I got to view 
other student’s work, some whose was better and some whose was worse than my own. This 
helped me gauge where I stand and how I could improve my research and report to better my 
score. Additionally, I had a meeting with my instructor as well as all the other A-Level students. 
We discussed our progress on the research and what we should be doing at this point.  

January	12	&	13,	2017:	
After reading other A level scaffoldings, I took time to reflect upon my own. I recognized that 
the lack of primary research is a limitation to my research report. Primary data, if collected and 
used in the right way, is more convincing than reproduced data. However, the nature of this topic 
lends itself to desk research because of the fact that it would be extremely difficult and not to 
mention dangerous for a student such as myself to collect data in least developed countries and 
hospitals. To compensate for this limitation, I feel my report utilizes the best sources and 
expertise in the field who did conduct their own research.  

January	16-18,	2017:	
Over this time, I continued peer reviewing other A-Level Scaffoldings. This process has helped 
me in ways I couldn’t have imagined. From other student’s work, I’ve realized some mistakes 
that others make that I didn’t know I made myself and this helped me to notice and correct that. 
Also, by helping others with analysis and evaluation, I have solidified my understandings of 
those terms and where I should be looking for it in my report. Furthermore, I had another 
meeting with my instructor and some other A-Level students. My instructor reviewed the 
syllabus with us and mentioned that we should not only be using it to make comments to our 
peers, but also when we are editing our own reports.  

January	19	&	20,	2017:	
My instructor presented me with an alternative task aside from my paper which is to teach skills 
necessary to successfully complete paper 1 to the AS global students. I understood this task and 
that it would help me better my skills in assessing the validity of an author and their arguments. I 
went about preparing this independently by reviewing past paper 1 exams and making notes on 
important things to remember when deconstructing an argument as well as how to analyze and 
compare the quality of their arguments and expertise. This task will especially help me not only 
when I am peer reviewing other’s papers but also when I am deciding whether to use an author in 



my own research report. Furthermore, I self-sufficiently instructed two other A level global 
students to help me teach these skills which would help them too in the near future.  

January	23-25,	2017:	
On Monday I received an email containing comments on my scaffolding from my peers. I have 
been spending time going through each peer’s comments and reflecting on how I need to change 
my essay to better it. While reading the comments, I noticed that many wrote about how I need 
to define or clarify certain aspects of my paper pertaining to medical terms or concepts. This 
reminded me that I needed to write this paper so that a non-specialized reader could understand 
it. In editing my paper, I plan to strongly consider explaining concepts that the average person 
wouldn’t understand and this will come in the form of further analysis of examples.  

January	26	&	27,	2017:	
Over this time, I have reviewed my work and decided I needed to reflect on where I started with 
this research and where I’ve come to. At the beginning of my research, I didn’t have an 
established opinion on organ trading and whether it is ethical. I assumed there was no problem 
with such a system because I thought how could a system that brings organs to people who need 
them be unethical. After immense research and many months of continuously reading on the 
subject, I realized there are various reasons as to why this isn’t ethical. The leading reason is that 
the system exploits the poor. Alternative reasons as to why organ trade isn’t ethical include, the 
system goes against religious beliefs and it results in postoperative complications. Looking at 
this side of this issue made me sympathetic to those who the system exploits, but at the same 
time I still see a system the ultimately helps people. As my aspiring career is to help people 
through the practice of medicine, this was an issue that I went back and forth with in my mind. Is 
one life worth more than another? People in less developed countries are dying to give their 
organs to people in developed countries. Eventually, I came to the conclusion that unless there 
are some serious restrictions that eliminate all forms of exploitation in this system, it cannot be 
ethical.  

January	30	&	31,	2017:	
I began editing my research report according to my peer’s comments. One comment that 
particularly stood out to me was that I needed to make my introduction into the topic more 
analytical. I re-read through this section of my report and I felt this comment was spot on. I will 
be spending this time making this section more analytical and with that evaluative to make sure I 
am reaching the maximum points where I can earn the most. I will additionally be reading 
through the rest of my paper to make sure the analysis and evaluation throughout is up to my 
standards.  

February	1-3,	2017:	
During this time, I reviewed my weakest example and decided to throw it out and find a better 
example to support my reason. I originally had a study proving that Americans would be more 
inclined to donate organs if they were payed to do so, but the study was a survey which doesn’t 
exactly prove this system would work. I instead replaced this with a study of where a system like 
this was put into place and it increased organ donations. This example far betters my claim that 



the market incentives increases the supply of transplant organs because it shows that a system 
like this would actually increase the supply of organs for transplantation.  

February	6	&	7,	2017:	
I took this time to review the Cambridge Learners guide before continuing in my editing of my 
report draft. I felt this was necessary at this point in my research to remind me of what specific 
aspects I need to work on in my essay. During this review, I realized that I needed to address my 
personal opinion on the subject. This is something I didn’t realize should be in my report because 
I thought that it was only necessary to give data and evaluate that, however, the learners guide 
expressed that it is beneficial for the reader to understand the author’s viewpoint. Moreover, I 
remembered to be sure to focus on the evaluation and analysis of my research findings in my 
essay.  

February	8-10,	2017:	
The scope of my research consists of all systems where organs are being exchanged for monetary 
compensation in all countries around the world. The analysis of ethicality in my research 
broadens the scope further considering ethicality can span a wide range of ideals. Nonetheless, as 
with any research, my research has limitations. One being that the use of case studies brings 
generalized findings that may or may not apply to all similar cases. For instance, the effects of 
one unit of analysis may not reflect all effects of the type. This means many of the drawing made 
from case studies might be slightly generalized. Another thing that is hard to avoid is the 
comparison of just a system of donation to a system of paid donation. It is arguably correct that 
some of the negatives to a system of paid donations are also negatives in a system of just 
donations, however, negatives are still negatives and the comparison of the two is unnecessary in 
my research.  

February	13	&	14,	2017:	
During this, I reviewed essays of peers partaking in A-Level Global. We exchanged essays for a 
final time to review each other’s work to ensure excellent research reports. The peer reviewing 
process always helps me to be thinking about things to work on in my own essay. I additionally 
understand the rubric and the grading process better when I have to use it to help other students 
with their essays. Beyond that, the process helps me because I get to see what others who have 
no experience in my research subject have to say about my report, which helps me in the editing 
process.  

February	15	&	16,	2017:	
I have been editing my essay according to my peer reviewer’s comments. While there were very 
few comments from most of my peers, I had a handful of very insightful comments given for me 
to work with. Ultimately I need to work on my introduction to make it more analytical, 
evaluative, and to apply it to my question. With my edits, my essay should be ready to submit.  

February	17,	2017:	
After finishing my research report, and thus my entire research process, I feel it is appropriate to 
write my last entry in reflection. Not only did I learn so much about research and writing that 
will beyond a doubt help me in college, but I also learned a significant amount about the subject 



of organ donation. While I do personally believe that a paid organ donation system is unethical, I 
clearly understand the arguments of the other side. The aspect of the issue that bothers me most 
is that the poor go through the system like a piece of meat in a factory with a price tag. It is 
absolutely unfair. A question that arose during my research that I genuinely wonder is whether 
there is a system that would increase the supply of transplant organs without creating 
exploitation or breaking norms of ethicality.  
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Brianna Dowd 

Reflective Paper #2 

 After grading several AS student’s scaffoldings, I’ve realized that there are numerous 

general areas that the students need to work on. First, and might I add most importantly, the 

validations need considerable work. The validations were very vague, often giving no actual data 

and including stock phrases such as “The author is credible because she’s written many articles.” 

I could have written many articles myself but this doesn’t prove my credibility. Additionally, the 

judgements for the validations were considerably lacking if present at all. The students need to 

reach an evaluative level of writing where their final sentence leaves the reader knowing why 

they used the source. The writing wasn’t at this level for possibly ninety percent of the students. 

Another area that needs work is the content analysis. From my perspective, it does not seem that 

the students are using the “Sally Makes Wine From Vines With Juice” tool. I believe using this 

would greatly increase the students’ level of analysis and make their writing less descriptive. 

Furthermore, less students, however still a notable amount, need to work on matching examples 

to reasons. I feel that several students blindly pulled articles off the internet that had a similarity 

to their reason thinking we wouldn’t check if it matched. Well we did, and they did not match. 

The example is there to prove that the reason is right, I don’t think some of the students 

understand that it is support. Hopefully in the essay, once transitions are added, it will become 

clear that the reason is followed with “For instance…” and logically an example that proves that 

reason would go after. In closing, students need to utilize the website when writing their essays. 

There are a plethora of tools and examples on the website, thus there is absolutely no excuse for 

not knowing these skills at this point.  

REFLECTION OF SCAFFOLDING



 Reading these scaffoldings has helped me to become a better writer in that I know what 

to look for when writing my own essay. What I mean by this is that I have witnessed the 

common mistakes that students close to my age make when writing their scaffoldings. This 

makes me extremely conscious of those mistakes, which will ensure that I do not make them 

when writing my own essay. Additionally, proof reading has sharpened my skills of finding 

examples that really prove the reason given. Once it comes time for me to make my own 

scaffolding, I will be much better at checking if my own examples are truly the best possible to 

prove the reason I give. Moreover, I have really noticed the level of analysis these students are 

writing and how much of a difference it makes to have strong analysis. This makes me better at 

writing analytical sentences because I know the level of analysis needed to really prove the 

reason and make a clear argument. In all, by reviewing other student’s work, I have pin pointed 

areas of general weakness, which I will know to avoid when writing my own essays.  



Brianna Dowd 

Student Update 

Rebekah Golden 

Question: Is water a human right? 

Thesis statement: Water is, and should be identified as, a human right, since it is necessary for 

human life, for consumption, and for cleanliness. However, some argue that water is not a human 

right. They say that water is no longer a human right when used for recreational purposes, and 

others believe water is not a human right at all, supporting the ability to treat water as a sellable 

good. 

Hailey Ballard 

Question: Is agriculture draining the world’s usable water supply? 

Thesis statement: Agriculture is draining the world’s usable water supply because crops and 

animals use too much local groundwater, areas in drought are still exporting crops overseas, and 

farmers are wasting water using outdated farming procedures. Nevertheless, some may argue that 

agriculture is not draining the global usable water supply because restrictions are already in place 

to reduce excess water from farms and most countries that export water use rainfall, not 

groundwater.  

Lizzie Houghton-Brown 

Question: Is water privatization negatively affecting less developed countries? 

Thesis statement: Water privatization is negatively affecting less developed countries because 

the quality of water is not as good as the quality of municipal water sources, water prices are 

increased, and not all people have access to clean water. However, some may argue that water 

WATER THESIS/QUESTION FOR EACH STUDENT



privatization is beneficial in less developed countries because it reduces the mortality rate and 

saves governments money. 

Jake Kolb 

Question: Should water be considered a public good? 

Thesis statement: Water should be considered a public good because water is a human right, 

privatization hurts the environment, and it decreases the cost of water. On the other hand, some 

may argue that water should not be considered a public good because privatization creates jobs, 

and can produce a large profit. 

Conor Andrich 

Question: Is water the new oil? 

Thesis statement: Water is the new oil because it has no substitute, we are already seeing 

conflicts over water, and privatization of water is driving up prices. Nevertheless, some may 

argue that water is not the new oil because we can conserve water, and water can be recycled and 

reused. 

Nathalie Ortiz 

Question: Are multinational water bottle companies the main cause of drought? 

Thesis statement: Multinational water bottle companies are not the main cause of drought 

because agriculture, water supply, and climate change are the true causes of drought. However, 

some may argue that multinational water bottle companies are the main cause of drought because 

they continue to pump water even during dry spells and this pumping of water creates a water 

shortage. 

John Peachey 

Question: Does exporting water have a negative effect on the ecosystem? 
 



Thesis statement: Exporting water has a negative effect on ecosystems because the transportation 

of water from one ecosystem to another has harmful effects on both ecosystems, the packaging 

of water into plastic bottles damages the air quality in ecosystems, and the packaging of water 

into plastic bottles damages the water quality in ecosystems. Nonetheless, some may argue that 

exporting water has a positive effect on ecosystems because exported water can be used to save 

ecosystems without water and it allows the towns of ecosystems with excess amounts of water to 

create income while managing the stability of the ecosystem. 

Tyler 

So far has not finished the question or thesis.  

 

 

 

 

 

 



Demonstration 

(question, quote, content analysis, source analysis, evaluation) 

*Mental Illness and psychiatric disorder will be used interchangeably and mean the same thing* 

Question: Are psychiatric disorders contagious? 

Reason: Psychiatric disorders are contagious because they can be triggered by infections.  

Example: “Research done at the John Hopkins Children’s Center and published in the Archives 

of General Psychiatry in 2001 found that mothers with evidence of Herpes Simplex Type 2 

infection at the time of pregnancy had children almost six times more likely to later develop 

schizophrenia. And in the US, Europe and Japan, birth clusters of individuals who develop 

schizophrenia later in life closely mirror the seasonal distribution of Ixodes ticks at the time of 

conception (Lyme disease)” (Strick, 2000).  

Source analysis: Frank Strick is a sagacious pundit, medical author, and the clinical research 

director of the Research Institute for Infectious Mental Illness, an institute which provides 

testing, clinical and consulting services to clients all over the world, nevertheless, Stick is 

financially invested in finding a link between infections and mental illness.   

Content analysis: The quote provided establishes that children whose mother had a Herpes 

infection during pregnancy were considerably more likely to develop the mental illness, 

schizophrenia. To further explain, there was a direct link found in the study between the 

infection, which can be spread from individual to individual, and the mental illness. If the 

infection is contagious, and the infection causes the psychiatric disorder, then it is beyond a 

reasonable doubt that the psychiatric disorder is contagious.  

SAMPLE SCAFFOLDING



Evaluation: The relation between the contagious infection and the psychiatric disorder proven in 

the example along with the authors profound background in clinical research proves the notion 

that psychiatric disorders are contagious since they can be triggered by infections. 
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Reflection on Group Work 

 There are always many difficulties when working in a group, however, the learning 

process and the final outcome is always the key. In this group work, I was considered the leader 

due to the fact that I was the A level student in a group of AS level students. The task among all 

the groups was to create a modified presentation according to the TED talk watched in class. My 

individual group’s task was to create the hook. As my group had many members who worked 

sufficiently on their own, I acted more as a moderator than a hands on member. They wanted to 

use a statistic in their hook and I suggested that they use it later on in the hook and address the 

audience right in the beginning in order to create a connection and spark interest. Additionally, 

the students had several ideas and I helped them to make it more personal and relatable to the 

audience.  

 When it came to working as a unit, I feel the group did well for the most part. As always 

there were a few that acted as the leaders and came up with the majority of the content. 

Considering this assignment had to be presented, one student volunteered to do the memorization 

and speaking and did so exquisitely. The group had a few members that didn’t contribute much 

although I tried to encourage all of them to participate. Nonetheless, the group generally did well 

working together and considering all suggestions including my own.  

 After the assignment was complete, the A level students along with Dr. Crihfield and 

myself chose a “winner” which was my group. I announced this to my group and also discussed 

with them the importance of working well in a group. I explained from my, a student’s 

perspective, how vital it is to choose good group members for the presentations. Furthermore, I 

told them to be sure to listen to all group member’s opinions because anyone could produce a 

good idea. This was some advice I could personally use because I sometimes am the one who 

GROUP PROJECT ON TED



takes lead and doesn’t consider others ideas. Overall, the experience taught me and the AS level 

students many lessons on working in a group.  



Reflection on Teaching 

 The process of teaching a lesson on analysis to AS level global students taught me many 

valuable lessons myself. The thought process and planning that went into preparing the lesson 

took the most time. I tried to devise how to teach the lesson in a way that the students would 

understand. In doing this, I came up with the idea to incorporate social media in the lesson which 

I knew the students would get engaged in. I had them analyze social media posts according to the 

thesis “Should I quit social media?”. I felt that this method worked well in teaching the students 

how to analyze. They understood the social media posts and realized that in analyzing, they 

didn’t need to summarize the post but simply explain how the post effected the thesis and why it 

was important in proving the thesis. In this activity, I noticed many students participating and 

actually analyzing the correct way. Something I would change about how I instructed the lesson 

is that I would have had another A level student record the different words of analysis that the 

students used in the activity so that I could remind them of the words they used. Aside from this, 

I believe the lesson went well overall.  

 The entire progression of teaching the lesson on analysis ultimately made me better at 

analyzing. Having to explain how to do it to other students confirmed my own idea of how to 

analyze. Furthermore, I feel much better about being able to analyze excerpts or quotes for my 

own research report considering I was able to grade and comment on each student’s analysis that 

they turned in to me. I additionally feel that my understanding between analysis and evaluation 

has deepened. Previous to this assignment, I didn’t have a solid understanding of the difference 

between the two, I just knew that I did both in my essays. I now feel that I can explain the 

difference not only to myself but to the many students that I taught.  



 In summation, the lesson on analysis benefitted the AS level students as well as myself. I 

have high hopes that the students will perform this task better on their scaffoldings and essays.  

 



Analysis Lesson 

Objective: Students will learn to analyze by learning the basis of analysis and applying it to 

current social media posts.  

Measurable objective: Students will turn in a sample analysis on a social media post of their 

choice done independently.  

Opening Explanation:  

In order to understand how and why water is important for the body, we have to break it apart. 

H2O would be broken into H-O-H 

In order to understand how and why 27 x 4 = 108, we have to break it apart. 

27 = 20 + 7 

4(20) = 80  

4(7) = 28 

80 + 28 = 108 

Analysis is the process of breaking apart the quote into simpler meaning in order to understand 

how and why it is important. 

So when analyzing a quote, break it apart and ask yourself “why is this important?” and “what is 
the effect of it?” 
 
Activity: 
Prezi on analyzing social media.  
http://prezi.com/0z6y1iouetpl/?utm_campaign=share&utm_medium=copy&rc=ex0share 
 
Kids should participate by analyzing the social media as to whether the instructor should quit 
social media based on the quotes given. This aspect of the activity will vary by class period 
depending on how the students feel about the quotes (as analysis is subjective this only makes 
sense).  
 
Closing activity/ assignment: 
Have students take their phone out and go on any social media of their choice.  
 
Have them write down one person's post and write a short analysis of whether that post would 
make them want to stay on social media or quit.  
 
Tell them to remember... 
Why is this important? What is the effect? 
 
Have students turn it in when they finish. 
 

TEACHING LESSON PLANS



FILL	IN	VALIDATIONS:	
 
For an organization: 

• The [name of organization] is [explain purpose], and while they [list good points] they 
are financially tied to [describe funding]. 

o Ex. “Pro-Poor Livestock Policy Initiative is a project that was launched by the 
Food and Agriculture Organization of the United Nations, and while they conduct 
research to provide evidence-based livestock sector and related policies that 
reduce poverty while managing environmental and public health risks, they are 
financially tied to the government of the United Kingdom.” 

 
For a non-profit: 

• The [name of non-profit] is [list good points], nevertheless, is [list bad points]. 
o Ex. “The Humane Society International is a world renowned, charitable 

organization that serves a critical and expanding role in global efforts to reduce 
animal suffering and seeks out innovative and scientifically sound approaches to 
animal welfare, nevertheless, is an activist organization and has emotional ties to 
animals.”  

 
For a journalist/non reputable author:  
 

• [author name] is [list good points], although he/she is a freelance writer not writing in 
their area of expertise. 

o Ex. “Monica Eng is presently an editor and reporter for the Chicago Tribune and 
has been for more than 15 years, she has reported in Central America, Central 
Asia and Europe covering the arts, leisure, ethnic culture and particularly food for 
various publications, although she is a freelance writer with no research 
experience.” 

 
For United Nations/affiliated groups: 
 

• The [United Nations/affiliated group] is [explain purpose and good points]. Nonetheless, 
as a nongovernmental organization, they do not have access to the same data as a 
governmental organization. 

o Ex. “The United Nations Entity for Gender Equality and the Empowerment of 
Women, or United Nations Women, is an entity of the United nations working for 
elimination of discrimination against women and girls, empowerment of women, 
and achievement of equality between women and men. Nonetheless, as a 
nongovernmental organization, they do not have access to the same data as a 
governmental organization.” 

• The [United Nations/affiliated group] is a global collective organization who has [list 
good points] yet, they are based on western democratic ideals. 

VALIDATIONS PROJECT



o Ex. “The World Health Organization is a global collective organization who has 
been producing articles and coordinating international health within the United 
Nations’ system since 1948, yet, they are based on western democratic ideals.” 

 
For a study: 
 

• [list contributors] did the study/project [title of study/project] for [reason of project and 
any good points]. While [list praises] the specific credentials of the contributors were 
undocumented. 

o Ex. “Kai Ling Toh, Pei Lin Grace Chia, Clint Kim Fat, Karen Chua Chiaco, & 
Serena Teo did the project of Water Privatization in Manila, Philippines: Should 
Water be Privatized? for their Master of Business Administration program at 
Insead. While this project received considerable praise from the institution, the 
specific credentials of the contributors were undocumented.” 

• The leader of this study is [name of leader], he/she is [list good points] and while he/she 
[list best point], his/her writings may be influenced by [name of source of influence].  

o Ex. The leader of this study is Wondimu Shanko Yirga, he is a public health 
specialist and academician who conducts international medical research and 
lectures in Ethiopia, and while he is a member of the international health 
economics association, his writings may be influenced by his employer’s 
interests.  

 
 

NEGATIVES	FOR	VALIDATION	STATEMENTS:	
 
Global Perspectives 

• As an American, she has a limited ability to write on Korean culture. 
• The organization does not have access to the same governmental resources and must 

obtain information on their own." 
• They have a strong personal religious stance on abortion 
• As a man, he has a limited ability to see a women’s perspective on the impact of abortion. 
• She has an emotional tie to the rights of women. 
• He has a financial investment and his reputation riding upon his writing. 
• She is presenting in Finland to their ministry of Social Affairs and Health so therefore 

may adopt a less accusatory approach to her argument when addressing governmental 
participation in world health. 

• He has a limited ability to see torture through the perspective of other people around the 
world who live in different cultures than him. 

• He has no institutional education in the field of torture. 
• His experience with ethics may prevent him from writing about torture without a slanted 

view. 
• They rely on donations to thrive and therefore will be more attentive to their reputation. 
• Many of the articles are not labeled with authors and it is unknown if the person who 

wrote them has the ability to speak accurately on the topic. 



• As a British citizen his writing may be slanted on the topic of British history. 
• She relies on her studies to be successful in her profession which may affect the results. 
• He has a love for nature, and this might prevent his work from being solely objective. 
• They are an activist organization and have an emotional tie to the environment. 
• They act in the interest of the chicken industry. 

 
History 

• It is expected that the strong Southern pride may cloud an objective look at the 
compromise between the North and the South. 

• It tends to have a heavily ironic tone and includes several exaggerated statements for 
effect. 

• It is taken from a first-hand account from a man who was recalling what he had 
experienced nearly 60 years before and his memory may have been shifted by the 
glorification of Lincoln as years go on. 

• It is filled with a hostile tone that makes it feel less factual and more emotionally biased. 
• At the time that he gave his speech, the Dred Scott decision was only decided months 

earlier and his speech is likely still affected by it. 
• Both of these speeches may also be impacted by the fact that James Buchanan has just 

been elected and the speakers were well-known political men. 
• The source was written some 30 years before the civil war and might not truly show the 

causes of it. 
• They might still be feeling the effects of the violence which occurred in their fellow 

western state, Kansas, which can largely be attributed to John Brown, the man who 
would later go on to Harper’s Ferry. 

• It is unknown where this cartoon came from, whether it be from the south, who was 
largely against Lincoln at this time, because it is the year of his election, or the north, 
who supported Lincoln overall. 

• He writes in the New York Tribune as the editor and might be more careful as to what he 
writes because the reputation of his paper rides upon his words 

• Although the historian’s modern age could be seen as an advantage, this factor may have 
prevented them from truly seeing opinions and national feelings at the time. 

 

KEYWORDS	AND	PHRASES	TO	SHORTEN	VALIDATIONS:	
 

Positive Words                   Negative Words 
 

§ John smith, a freelance writer for [Insert esteemed magazine, website, organization] 
§ John smith, while showing a vested interest, is a scholar in [Insert the field of study] 
§ World renowned ad hoc speech writer John Smith  
§ John Smith, a revered [insert job title] with a [insert a specific view] 

 
Ex: Mason Gaffney- a profound economist with a Georgian point of view- presented a cure,   
           which is to implement Georgist policy to failing cities. 
         



Ex. Dr. Robert Carter is an esteemed scientist focused on debunking Climate Change. 
** What is negative is that they solely focus all their time to look at one side or solution to the 
problem 
 

QUESTIONS	THAT	DETERMINE	VALIDITY	OF	A	SOURCE:	
 

• Does the article come from a reliable website? 
• Blog vs well-known and cited website 
• What is the reputation of the website? 

• Does the article have an author? 
• It can still be valid if it doesn’t if the website is well-known and respected, but 

this would be a negative aspect of the source 
• What is the authors education background/what is their expertise? 

• Are they an infield scholar? 
• What is the authors current occupation? 

• Freelance writer vs and infield professor 
• If they are a well-published author, what were the other topics discussed? 
• Look at the content as well 

• Is it fact or judgement? 
• Both are okay to use as long as they are credible (which related back to the 

author) 
• If you are using a source that deals with an interview, does the interviewee have expertise 

on the subject? 

• Is the source global? (especially useful question for AS students) 

 

EXAMPLES	OF	VALIDITY	STATEMENTS:	
 

• While the majority of this piece is the result of judgement, Dr. Anthony Tommasini, 
being the chief music critic for The New York Times, a published author, as well as 
holding an in-field doctorate offers a developed and credible opinion on the subject.  

• While this example comes from a blog section of a well-known American Newspaper, 
Juval Aviv, who began his career as the office in the Israel Defense Force and is currently 
a special consultant to the US Congress on issues of terrorism and security, offers a 
dependable worldwide viewpoint on the issue of artificial intelligence in relation to 
terrorism. 

• Although Dr. Mahesh Saptharishi has extensive knowledge on the subject of developing 
intelligent video analytics technology, he is the CEO of a company which main focus is 
on video cameras dealing with security surveillance giving him a vested interest in the 
subject making him not the most impartial source but information and ideas given do in 
fact confirm the idea that AI increases security. 



• Although the article was written for an American based newspaper, the author has a high 
vested interest in the well-being of Latin America, as his job is closely related to the 
Argentine Ministry of Education, giving him an educated, international viewpoint. 

• Although no substantial information can be found on her, Jane Wakefield is a prolific 
author, haven written over 200 articles for BBC, giving her dependability as a continuous 
author of a well-known and respected publication. 

 

ADDITIONAL	HELP:	
 
When using a source without an author 

• Look at the site the source comes from 
• Research the source, noticing the credentials of the source 

 
When using an author on a subject out of their expertise 

• Research the author and see if they’ve done anything in the field to give them reputability 
• Example: an author/scholar out of field 

 
When using a source with a vested interest 

• Research the reason behind the vested interest 
• If the reason is money – don’t use the source!!!! 
• If the reason is passion – the source is okay to use, but don’t use it as a main 

source. Use it as a secondary source to back up a main idea 
• Example: a predisposed/partial/skewed/prejudice source 

 
When using an author without a steady career 

• Research their credentials 
• Example: a prolific, freelance writer 

 
 
 
 

	
 

















Organ trafficking research findings: 
• Split into three main categories: 

o traffickers force or deceive the victims into giving up an organ 
o victims formally or informally agree to sell an organ and are cheated because they 

are not paid for the organ or are paid less than the promised price 
o vulnerable persons are treated for an ailment, which may or may not exist and 

thereupon organs are removed without the victim's knowledge 
http://www.ungift.org/knowledgehub/en/about/trafficking-for-organ-trade.html 

• People in China are offered $4,000 and an iPad for “donating” their kidney.  
• In hard economic situations, people easily fall into the trap of giving up their organs 

when told they will be payed. This pay often never comes.  
 
Saving lives vs killing them: 

• People in LDC’s need to have access to cheap organ to affordably replace their own 
• The opportunities to sell their organs may help people financially 
• The harvesting and selling of organs is a business and many people rely on this business 

 
• People are often tricked into selling their organs which ruins their health later in life 
• People are murdered for their organs 
• Some traffickers get caught in the ring and devote their lives to harvesting 
• The business is funding bad causes such as ISIS 

 
Are human organs a commodity?  
 
 

Mental Illness Research findings: 
Can a person catch mental illness? 

• No 
o Mental illness is caused by genetics (hereditary), biological mishaps such as brain 

abnormalities from birth, or a combination of these 
• Yes  

o Mental illness is caused by exposure to common germs in everyday life 
o Cat litter can lead to schizophrenia  
o Strep throat can trigger OCD in teens 



Brianna Dowd 

A Level Global Perspectives 

14 September 2016 

Update 

Topics:  

1. Organ trafficking  

2. Psychiatric disorders 

Working Questions:  

1. Organ trafficking: saving lives or ruining them? 

2. Can you catch mental illness? 

Books currently checked out: 

1. The Red Market by Scott Carney 

2. The Slaughter by Ethan Gutmann 

3. Anatomy of an Epidemic by Robert Whitaker 

4. Infectious Madness by Harriet A. Washington 

Plan for books: 

I decided to keep a running list of notes for each of the books I will read. These lists will be 

comprised of facts that I want to remember, things I believe are interesting, notes for direction of 

my essay, and anything else pertaining to my research that I believe will help me. These lists will 

then be used to plan my research and construct my scaffolding once the time comes. 



Brianna Dowd 

P.5 

Reflection on Scavenger Hunt 

My team to create, instruct, and execute a scavenger hunt for the AS Level Global 

students consisted of Joseph, Vinny, Sierra, and myself. Although, Vinny did not take part in 

creating the hunt and Sierra did not take part in the instruction and execution.  

To create the hunt, Joseph, Sierra, and I utilized resources given to us, such as past 

scavenger hunts and the internet. We had to work as a team to come up with different tasks that 

the students had to complete in order to win. We decided it would be best organized if we split 

up the tasks into different categories, depending on what the task consisted of. After we 

determined our categories, we had to come up with a variety of missions for the hunt that would 

range from easy to difficult. This was the toughest part of working in a group because we each 

had distinctive ideas as to what is considered fun, difficult, learning, etc. However, these 

differences are what gave the exercises variety. This was important, especially in making a 

scavenger hunt, to create a diversity of options that the kids could choose from so that not all of 

the activities involved running around campus or sitting in the classroom. Considering Joseph, 

Sierra, and I have very different notions about the scavenger hunt categories and levels of 

difficulty, this worked in our favor.  

When instructing the hunt, my team consisted of Joseph, Vinny, and I. As I am usually 

the one in the group that steps up and takes charge, it comes as no surprise that in this part of the 

activity, I became the leader. Our instructor, Dr. Crihfield, gave us a certain set of instructions 

that we must say and left the rest for us to determine. In the beginning of the class, I gave the 

instructions that we had to say as well as some other instructions that pertained to our specific 



scavenger hunt to the students. Some of the required instructions were that students must behave, 

have a pass with them at all times, and get signatures for every completed item. Some of my 

specific instructions included making sure every group member took part in certain activities and 

clarifying that not everyone had to be a part of others. This part of the activity went relatively 

smoothly considering the students payed attention the entire time and followed the instructions.  

The final part of the scavenger hunt activity was the execution, in which Joseph, Vinny, 

and I took part in. In this, I can say we all took equal responsibility because we each were 

assigned a team and were required to monitor and sign off for our team only. This kept us busy 

for the majority of the time because the teams generally split up and would come back for 

signatures throughout the time period. The other half of this portion of the activity consisted of 

reiterating the instructions to the students when they occasionally forgot or had questions. This 

proved to be difficult as Vinny and Joseph did not always tell the other groups the same 

instructions that I initially gave. To fix this, I had to monitor what they were telling the other 

groups and correct them if they gave false instructions. I believe, for Vinny, this was the hardest 

part because he was absent when we made the scavenger hunt, so he did not fully understand 

what we were thinking of when we created the project.  

At the beginning of this assignment, I did not fully understand the difficulties that I 

would come across nor how challenging it would be to direct and execute an entire activity with 

a team. Although this activity may have been arduous, it taught me a lot about teamwork. I 

learned that although it may be easier for me to take charge of the teamwork, it is not always 

beneficial to do so. This is because others may have a different perspective on the assignment in 

such a way that I never would have thought of. These different perspectives were crucial for this 

activity. If I had taken charge and done all the work by myself, the students may have not had as 



much fun or learned as much as they would have otherwise. Additionally, I learned that it is still 

important to have one group member who is ready to jump in and lead, such as myself. I realized 

that if we had all tried to give instructions, the activity would have become chaotic and the 

students would be confused. Largely, I learned that teamwork is an important aspect of learning 

and that I should respect other’s opinions because they may help me to create an overall better 

product.   

 

 

 

 

 

Comments: 

“Considering Joseph, Sierra, and I have very different notions about the scavenger hunt 

categories and levels of difficulty, this worked in our favor.” Comment: Yes 

“I believe, for Vinny, this was the hardest part because he was absent when we made the 

scavenger hunt, so he did not fully understand what we were thinking of when we created the 

project.” Comment: � 

“I learned that although it may be easier for me to take charge of the teamwork, it is not always 

beneficial to do so.” Comment: ��

“Largely, I learned that teamwork is an important aspect of learning and that I should respect 

other’s opinions because they may help me to create an overall better product.” Comment: Yes 

 

 


